
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 14-14077

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Naco Pump Station Well No. 4 & Micron Pump Station Well No. 3

FOR: Pump Replacement

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 20, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

NACO WELL PUMP NO. 4 REPLACEMENT  

1 LS UNIT

Pump: Fabricate and deliver pumping unit (includes coating, and vortex suppressor) PRICE

1. in accordance with drawings and specifications TOTAL 19,389.00 22,000.00 NO BID

1 EA UNIT

Pump Well Head: Fabricate and deliver in accordance with drawings and PRICE

2. specifications TOTAL 17,193.00 19,500.00 NO BID

278+/- LF UNIT

Column Piping: Fabricate and deliver 16-inch column pipe (includes coating) in PRICE 420.00 478.00

3. accordance with drawings and specifications TOTAL 116,760.00 132,884.00 NO BID

280+/- LF UNIT

Line Shaft: fabricate and deliver (includes couplings and bearings) in accordance PRICE 34.50 38.00

4. with drawings and specifications TOTAL 9,660.00 10,640.00 NO BID

1 LS UNIT

Motor: Fabricate and deliver (includes coating) in accordance with drawings PRICE

5. and specifications TOTAL 53,315.00 60,500.00 NO BID

1 LS UNIT

Assemble, and install pumping unit, components described above, and lube line PRICE

6. in accordance with drawings and specifications TOTAL 6,000.00 13,500.00 NO BID

UNIT

1 LS PRICE

7. Field Acceptance Testing TOTAL 10,000.00 15,000.00 NO BID

1 LS UNIT

Existing Submersible Pump Removal and Disposal - Includes removal and hauling of PRICE

8. existing submersible pump, discharge elbow and column piping TOTAL 1,000.00 2,000.00 NO BID

*

TOTAL BID PRICING FOR NACO WELL PUMP NO. 4 ITEM 1-8 TOTAL 233,317.00 276,024.00 NO BID

MICRON WELL PUMP NO. 3 REPLACEMENT UNIT

1 LS

Pump: Fabricate and deliver pumping unit (includes coating, and vortex suppressor) PRICE

1. in accordance with drawings and specifications TOTAL 29,695.00 33,800.00 NO BID

1 EA UNIT

Pump Well Head: Fabricate and deliver in accordance with drawings and PRICE

2. specifications TOTAL 17,545.00 19,000.00 NO BID

255+/- LF UNIT

Column Piping: Fabricate and deliver 20-inch column pipe (includes coating) in PRICE 616.75 700.00

3. accordance with drawings and specifications TOTAL 157,271.25 178,500.00 NO BID
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 14-14077

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Naco Pump Station Well No. 4 & Micron Pump Station Well No. 3

FOR: Pump Replacement

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 20, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY P
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257+/- LF UNIT

Line Shaft: fabricate and deliver (includes couplings and bearings) in accordance PRICE 85.00 95.00

4. with drawings and specifications TOTAL 21,845.00 24,415.00 NO BID

1 LS UNIT

Motor: Fabricate and deliver (includes coating) in accordance with drawings PRICE

5. and specifications TOTAL 93,705.00 99,700.00 NO BID

1 LS UNIT

Assemble, and install pumping unit, components described above, and lube line PRICE

6. in accordance with drawings and specifications TOTAL 8,000.00 13,500.00 NO BID

UNIT

1 LS PRICE

7. Field Acceptance Testing TOTAL 11,500.00 15,000.00 NO BID

1 LS UNIT

Existing Submersible Pump Removal and Disposal - Includes removal and hauling of PRICE

8. existing submersible pump, discharge elbow and column piping TOTAL 6,500.00 7,500.00 NO BID

*

TOTAL BID PRICING FOR MICRON WELL PUMP NO. 3 ITEM 1-8 TOTAL 346,061.25 391,415.00 NO BID

Net Net  

Terms 30 days 30 days  

 

 

Delivery     

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Alsay Demandstar

Conhagen SAWS Website

DXP

Layne

Peerless Equipment  
Pump Solutions

San Antonio Armature

Smith Pump 
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